
 

 

 
 

 

 
 

 
 

  
 

  
 

 

 
 

 
 

 

  
 

  
 
 
 
 

AP® MACROECONOMICS 
2012 SCORING GUIDELINES  

Question 3 

6 points (2 + 1 + 1 + 2) 

(a)  2 points: 
• One point is earned for drawing a correctly labeled graph and showing the AD and SRAS curves 

and PL1. 
• One point is earned for showing a vertical LRAS curve at the output Y1 through the intersection of 

the SRAS and AD curves. 

(b) 1 point: 
•  One point is earned for showing a rightward shift of the aggregate demand curve and showing Y2 

and PL2. 

(c) 1 point: 
•  One point is earned for stating that real wages will fall because the price level has increased and 

the nominal wages are fixed in the short run. 

(d) 2 points: 
• One point is earned for stating that the investment component of AD will change. 
• One point is earned for stating that the long-run aggregate supply curve will shift to the right 

because the capital stock has increased. 
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AP® MACROECONOMICS 
2012 SCORING COMMENTARY 

Question 3 

Overview 

Part (a) examined the students’ ability to draw an aggregate supply-and-demand diagram depicting an 
economy at full employment. Part (b) tested the students’ ability to show the effects of an increase in a 
country’s exports on the country’s equilibrium price level and equilibrium real GDP. Part (c) tested the 
students’ ability to explain the effect of an increase in exports on real wages in the short run. Part (d) 
tested students’ ability to identify the component of aggregate demand affected by an increase in firms’ 
expenditures on equipment and to explain the effect of the increased equipment expenditures on long-run 
aggregate supply. 

Sample: 3A 
Score: 6 

The student answers all parts of the question correctly and so earned all 6 points. 

Sample: 3B 
Score: 4 

The student’s graph is correct and so earned both points in part (a). In part (b) the student correctly shifts 
the aggregate demand curve to the right and shows the new equilibrium output and price level and so 
earned 1 point. The student incorrectly concludes that the price level increase results in a higher real wage 
and so did not earn the point in part (c). In part (d) the student correctly identifies investment as the 
component of aggregate demand that changes, and thus earned the first point, but the student fails to 
provide a correct explanation for the rightward shift of the long-run aggregate supply curve and so did not 
earn the second point. 

Sample: 3C 
Score: 2 

In part (a) the student’s graph correctly shows the equilibrium output and price level and the position of the 
long-run aggregate supply curve, and so earned both points. The student does not shift the aggregate 
demand curve and so did not earn the point in part (b). In part (c) the student incorrectly concludes that a 
decrease in the price level causes real wages to decrease and so lost 1 point. The student did not earn either 
point in part (d). First, the student fails to provide the component of aggregate demand that changes as a 
result of the purchase of container ships and equipment. Second, the student does not provide a correct 
explanation of the shift of the long-run aggregate supply curve. 
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